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In Dos Rios, Texas, life is all about borders -- and what happens when you cross the line.

Nothing is simple in a border town like Dos Rios, in the Rio Grande Valley of Texas. Even for high school
students Fabiola Garza and her younger sister Alexis, whose parents run a local Tex-Mex restaurant, Dos
Rios is full of borders -- where you should go, who your friends should be, which boy you should date.

Dos Rios is also full of opportunities, but it's a town divided, between the haves and the have-nots, the
Whites and the Mexicans-Americans, the Texans and the Mexicans, the legal and illegal. But through it all,
the Garza sisters have each other. Water can be crossed, but blood is the ultimate borderline -- no matter
what.
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From reader reviews:

Walter Crouse:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading. Yeah,
by reading a reserve your ability to survive raise then having chance to stay than other is high. For you who
want to start reading a new book, we give you that Border Town #1: Crossing the Line book as beginning
and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Joyce Williams:

Here thing why this specific Border Town #1: Crossing the Line are different and reputable to be yours. First
of all examining a book is good but it depends in the content of computer which is the content is as delicious
as food or not. Border Town #1: Crossing the Line giving you information deeper since different ways, you
can find any e-book out there but there is no book that similar with Border Town #1: Crossing the Line. It
gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing which happened in the
world which is probably can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in recreation
area, café, or even in your way home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the published book
maybe the form of Border Town #1: Crossing the Line in e-book can be your substitute.

Jill Beery:

Beside this particular Border Town #1: Crossing the Line in your phone, it can give you a way to get closer
to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh through the
oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow commune. It is good
thing to have Border Town #1: Crossing the Line because this book offers to you personally readable
information. Do you occasionally have book but you would not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that
won't happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, such as
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this book along with read it from
today!

Gay Swiderski:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many question for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book but additionally novel and Border Town #1: Crossing the Line as
well as others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel
desire to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those
guides are helping them to increase their knowledge. In various other case, beside science guide, any other
book likes Border Town #1: Crossing the Line to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book
like here.
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