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In Singing in Greek: A Guide to Greek Lyric Diction and Vocal Repertoire, Lydía Zervanos reveals to
singers the vast riches of Greek vocal music. Dating back to 1770, Greek art music—following the Western
European styles, often drawing on themes from folk music and motifs—long awaits its rightful place in a
truly international vocal repertoire. Modern singers in search of new musical opportunities will find in
Singing in Greek the necessary tools to locate and perform art songs and arias from this extensive national
vocal repertoire.

Concisely written and full of practical advice, the book opens with an introduction to the Greek alphabet and
pronunciation, navigating the assignment of International Phonetic Alphabet symbols. Zervanos covers such
topics as Greek vowels, digraphs, consonants, binary consonants, consonant combinations, palatalization,
basic Greek grammatical concepts and their role in stress and length, syllabification, and punctuation—all
separated into easily referenced chapters and supported by online recordings of native Greek opera singers.

In the second half of Singing in Greek, Zervanos offers a short history of Greek art music, biographies of
prominent Greek composers, texts of their most representative works with IPA transcriptions, and word-for-
word and poetic translations, with arias and art songs chosen for all voice types and levels. This book also
includes indexes of direct vowel-to-IPA and consonant-to-IPA transcriptions, as well as useful appendixes
on publications, organizations, and famous Greek poets.

Singing in Greek is a must-have resource for every singer, voice teacher, vocal coach, collaborative pianist,
and opera and choral conductor seeking to perform and teach in this unique language, explore the wealth of
music available, and expand their knowledge of Greek repertoire.
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Louis:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you already been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Singing in Greek: A Guide
to Greek Lyric Diction and Vocal Repertoire (Guides to Lyric Diction), it is possible to enjoy both. It is fine
combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout
guys. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Lola Hernandez:

This Singing in Greek: A Guide to Greek Lyric Diction and Vocal Repertoire (Guides to Lyric Diction) is
great guide for you because the content that is full of information for you who also always deal with world
and possess to make decision every minute. This book reveal it facts accurately using great organize word or
we can claim no rambling sentences included. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole data
in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but hard core information with splendid
delivering sentences. Having Singing in Greek: A Guide to Greek Lyric Diction and Vocal Repertoire
(Guides to Lyric Diction) in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous 1. We
can say that no book that offer you world within ten or fifteen moment right but this reserve already do that.
So , it is good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt in which?

Andrew Taylor:

It is possible to spend your free time to see this book this book. This Singing in Greek: A Guide to Greek
Lyric Diction and Vocal Repertoire (Guides to Lyric Diction) is simple bringing you can read it in the park,
in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not get much space to bring the particular printed book, you
can buy the e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone.
Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Jerry Blair:

In this particular era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What
you must do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to experience a look at some books.
Among the books in the top list in your reading list is definitely Singing in Greek: A Guide to Greek Lyric
Diction and Vocal Repertoire (Guides to Lyric Diction). This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry
Inclines can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking upwards and review this e-book you
can get many advantages.
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