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The outbreak of "The Troubles" in Northern Ireland in 1968 found many of the local police and army
auxiliary units outmoded or discredited. A new and unique force of part-time soldiers was created: The
Ulster Defence Regiment.

A Testimony to Courage vividly describes the threat under which not just the soldiers but their families also
had to live, and records the murders of some of the 197 members killed as a result of terrorist attack. It
addresses how the Regiment became mainly Protestant as a result of the loss of Nationalist support and
recruits, and the constant criticism of the Irish Government and Nationalist politicians. A final chapter
records objectively the lessons to be learnt from this unique experience. This book is not an official history
as such but more a thorough record of the UDR's dramatic 23 year existence.
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From reader reviews:

Raymond Lee:

Book is actually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can know everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Next to
that you can your reading ability was fluently. A reserve Testimony to Courage: The History of the Ulster
Defence Regiment 1969-1992 will make you to become smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence
if you can know about anything. But some of you think that will open or reading any book make you bored.
It is far from make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or
acceptable book with you?

William Troutt:

The book Testimony to Courage: The History of the Ulster Defence Regiment 1969-1992 can give more
knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the
good thing like a book Testimony to Courage: The History of the Ulster Defence Regiment 1969-1992?
Several of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim that book can give many data for us. It is
absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or information that you take
for that, you are able to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Testimony to Courage: The
History of the Ulster Defence Regiment 1969-1992 has simple shape however you know: it has great and
massive function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by start and read a guide. So it is very
wonderful.

Eileen Vaughan:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the concept Testimony to
Courage: The History of the Ulster Defence Regiment 1969-1992 suitable to you? The actual book was
written by famous writer in this era. The actual book untitled Testimony to Courage: The History of the
Ulster Defence Regiment 1969-1992is a single of several books that everyone read now. This kind of book
was inspired many men and women in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new age that
you ever know prior to. The author explained their idea in the simple way, so all of people can easily to
know the core of this book. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. So you can
see the represented of the world with this book.

Albert Lightner:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Testimony to Courage: The
History of the Ulster Defence Regiment 1969-1992 can be the respond to, oh how comes? The new book you
know. You are so out of date, spending your time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek
activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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