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Richard Horatio Edgar Wallace was born on the 1st April 1875 in Greenwich, London. Leaving school at 12
because of truancy, by the age of fifteen he had experience; selling newspapers, as a worker in a rubber
factory, as a shoe shop assistant, as a milk delivery boy and as a ship’s cook. By 1894 he was engaged but
broke it off to join the Infantry being posted to South Africa. He also changed his name to Edgar Wallace
which he took from Lew Wallace, the author of Ben-Hur. In Cape Town in 1898 he met Rudyard Kipling
and was inspired to begin writing. His first collection of ballads, The Mission that Failed! was enough of a
success that in 1899 he paid his way out of the armed forces in order to turn to writing full time. By 1904 he
had completed his first thriller, The Four Just Men. Since nobody would publish it he resorted to setting up
his own publishing company which he called Tallis Press. In 1911 his Congolese stories were published in a
collection called Sanders of the River, which became a bestseller. He also started his own racing papers,
Bibury’s and R. E. Walton’s Weekly, eventually buying his own racehorses and losing thousands gambling.
A life of exceptionally high income was also mirrored with exceptionally large spending and debts. Wallace
now began to take his career as a fiction writer more seriously, signing with Hodder and Stoughton in 1921.
He was marketed as the ‘King of Thrillers’ and they gave him the trademark image of a trilby, a cigarette
holder and a yellow Rolls Royce. He was truly prolific, capable not only of producing a 70,000 word novel
in three days but of doing three novels in a row in such a manner. It was in, estimating that by 1928 one in
four books being read was written by Wallace, for alongside his famous thrillers he wrote variously in other
genres, including science fiction, non-fiction accounts of WWI which amounted to ten volumes and screen
plays. Eventually he would reach the remarkable total of 170 novels, 18 stage plays and 957 short stories.
Wallace became chairman of the Press Club which to this day holds an annual Edgar Wallace Award,
rewarding ‘excellence in writing’. Diagnosed with diabetes his health deteriorated and he soon entered a
coma and died of his condition and double pneumonia on the 7th of February 1932 in North Maple Drive,
Beverly Hills. He was buried near his home in England at Chalklands, Bourne End, in Buckinghamshire.
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From reader reviews:

Angela Rodriguez:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider while those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now's taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you receive the
unstable resource then you have it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen within you if you take The Just Men Of Cordova: "An intellectual is
someone who has found something more interesting than sex." as your daily resource information.

Walter Blankenship:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get lot of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , if we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely
sure. People is human not only a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you possess when
the spare time coming to a person of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading guides. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, typically the book you have read is
actually The Just Men Of Cordova: "An intellectual is someone who has found something more interesting
than sex.".

Christina Webb:

This The Just Men Of Cordova: "An intellectual is someone who has found something more interesting than
sex." is great reserve for you because the content and that is full of information for you who else always deal
with world and get to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it facts accurately using great
organize word or we can say no rambling sentences included. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have
whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but tricky core
information with attractive delivering sentences. Having The Just Men Of Cordova: "An intellectual is
someone who has found something more interesting than sex." in your hand like finding the world in your
arm, data in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no book that offer you world with ten or fifteen
small right but this publication already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. busy
do you still doubt in which?

Jason Rickman:

The book untitled The Just Men Of Cordova: "An intellectual is someone who has found something more
interesting than sex." contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with
easy means. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read
that. The book was written by famous author. The author will bring you in the new period of time of literary
works. You can read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or device, so you can read the



book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their
official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice learn.
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