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The growing synergy of humans and technology--from dialysis to genetically altered foods to PET scans--is
transforming how we view our minds and our bodies. But how has it changed the body politic? How can we
forge a society that protects the rights of human and cyborg alike?

The creator of the cult classic Cyborg Handbook, Chris Hables Gray, now offers the first guide to
"posthuman" politics, framing the key issues that could threaten or brighten our technological future. For
good or ill, politics has already been cyborged in ways that touch us all: On-line voting promises to change
who participates. Wars are won on video screens. Biotechnological advances-- cloning, sexual prostheses,
gene patents--are redefining life, death, and family in ways that strain the social contract. In the face of these
advances, visions of the cyborg future range from the utopian to the nightmarish, from a spiritual super-race
transcending the body's confines to a soulless Borg consuming human individuality.

Only with a broad, historically rich and ethically grounded understanding of these issues, Gray argues, can
we combat the threats to our freedom and even our survival. A work of vision and imagination, Cyborg
Citizen lays the groundwork for the participatory evolution of our society.
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From reader reviews:

Janice Smith:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its handle may doesn't work
at this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer could be Cyborg Citizen: Politics in the Posthuman Age why because
the wonderful cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint an individual.
The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will
directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Calvin Lee:

This Cyborg Citizen: Politics in the Posthuman Age is great book for you because the content which can be
full of information for you who else always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. That
book reveal it information accurately using great manage word or we can claim no rambling sentences within
it. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you
with straight forward sentences but difficult core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having
Cyborg Citizen: Politics in the Posthuman Age in your hand like finding the world in your arm, information
in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no reserve that offer you world in ten or fifteen second right but
this book already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt
which?

Beth French:

This Cyborg Citizen: Politics in the Posthuman Age is brand new way for you who has attention to look for
some information as it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more
you know or you who still having bit of digest in reading this Cyborg Citizen: Politics in the Posthuman Age
can be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside this specific book is easy to get by
simply anyone. These books develop itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the
e-book type. People who think that in publication form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this book is the
answer. So there isn't any in reading a book especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should
be here for a person. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book variety for your better life and also
knowledge.

Lucy Carson:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our information for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year seemed
to be exactly added. This guide Cyborg Citizen: Politics in the Posthuman Age was filled regarding science.
Spend your time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has various feel
when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can really feel enjoy to



read a reserve. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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