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Luther’s Works: The American Edition, published by Concordia and Fortress Press between 1955 and 1986,
comprises fifty-five volumes. These are a selection representing only about a third of Luther’s works in the
Latin and German of the standard Weimar Edition, not including the German Bible. The year 1525 was
perhaps one of the most tumultuous for Luther and his Reformation. It was the year of the break between
Luther and a number of forces heretofore presumed to be on his side. The ultra-radical reformers alienated
the lower classes from the Lutheran Reformation with the charge that Luther was only a halfway reformer.
Luther responded with Against the Heavenly Prophets. In May Luther tried to avert a peasant uprising by an
appeal both to the princes and to the peasants. But the Peasant Revolt broke out nevertheless, and Luther
responded with Against the Robbing and Murdering Hordes of Peasants. 1525 was also the year when world
famous scholar Erasmus declared himself against Luther, provoking him into responding with On the
Bondage of the Will. This, plus the death of friends, his protector prince, and rumor of an assassin coming
for Luther from Poland, was still not enough to prevent Luther from continuing his lectures on the minor
prophets. This volume demonstrates Luther's perseverance and triumph against all odds. Luther's
commentary on Zechariah points to Zechariah as "an outstanding model" in comforting people not to despair
when the promises of Christ's kingdom do not seem to come true. This comfort is for all time.
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From reader reviews:

David Sweet:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book called Luther's Works, Vol. 20:
Lectures on the Minor Prophets III? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You know beside you can spend
your time with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you
have different opinion?

Randall Blake:

The experience that you get from Luther's Works, Vol. 20: Lectures on the Minor Prophets III could be the
more deep you digging the information that hide in the words the more you get interested in reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Luther's Works, Vol. 20: Lectures on the Minor Prophets
III giving you thrill feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in selected way that can be understood
by means of anyone who read it because the author of this publication is well-known enough. This book also
makes your own vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go to you, both in
printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having this kind of Luther's Works, Vol. 20:
Lectures on the Minor Prophets III instantly.

James Johnson:

The book Luther's Works, Vol. 20: Lectures on the Minor Prophets III has a lot info on it. So when you read
this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The author makes
some research prior to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily
after perusing this book.

Susan Gaier:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Make
an effort to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in
the outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer may be Luther's Works, Vol. 20: Lectures on the Minor
Prophets III why because the excellent cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint an
individual. The inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth
sense will directly show you to pick up this book.
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