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étienne Balibar has been one of Europe's most important philosophical and political thinkers since the 1960s.
His work has been vastly influential on both sides of the Atlantic throughout the humanities and the social
sciences. In We, the People of Europe?, he expands on themes raised in his previous works to offer a
trenchant and eloquently written analysis of "transnational citizenship" from the perspective of contemporary
Europe. Balibar moves deftly from state theory, national sovereignty, and debates on multiculturalism and
European racism, toward imagining a more democratic and less state-centered European citizenship.

Although European unification has progressively divorced the concepts of citizenship and nationhood, this
process has met with formidable obstacles. While Balibar seeks a deep understanding of this critical
conjuncture, he goes beyond theoretical issues. For example, he examines the emergence, alongside the
formal aspects of European citizenship, of a "European apartheid," or the reduplication of external borders in
the form of "internal borders" nurtured by dubious notions of national and racial identity. He argues for the
democratization of how immigrants and minorities in general are treated by the modern democratic state, and
the need to reinvent what it means to be a citizen in an increasingly multicultural, diversified world. A major
new work by a renowned theorist, We, the People of Europe? offers a far-reaching alternative to the usual
framing of multicultural debates in the United States while also engaging with these debates.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Levi:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice simply by
surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
Sure, by reading a reserve your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand than other is high. To
suit your needs who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this particular We, the People of
Europe?: Reflections on Transnational Citizenship (Translation/Transnation) book as nice and daily reading
reserve. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Cheryl Alexander:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or all
their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic from the
park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill your
free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book could be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The first
thing you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to try out look for book, may
be the guide untitled We, the People of Europe?: Reflections on Transnational Citizenship
(Translation/Transnation) can be great book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Susan Ross:

This We, the People of Europe?: Reflections on Transnational Citizenship (Translation/Transnation) is great
e-book for you because the content that is full of information for you who have always deal with world and
get to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it information accurately using great organize
word or we can point out no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole
information in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but tricky core
information with lovely delivering sentences. Having We, the People of Europe?: Reflections on
Transnational Citizenship (Translation/Transnation) in your hand like getting the world in your arm, data in
it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no publication that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen
small right but this publication already do that. So , it is good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. busy do you
still doubt which?

David Johnston:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside with friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like We, the People of Europe?:
Reflections on Transnational Citizenship (Translation/Transnation) which is keeping the e-book version. So ,



why not try out this book? Let's find.
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