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Medical Geology is a rapidly growing field concerned with the relationship between natural geological
factors and human and animal health, as well as with improving our understanding of the influence of
environmental factors on the geographical distribution of health problems. This book brings together the
work of geoscientists and medical/public health researchers, which addresses health problems caused, or
exacerbated by geological materials (rocks, minerals, atmospheric dust and water) and processes (including
volcanic eruptions and earthquakes. Among the environmental health problems discussed in this book are:
exposure to toxic levels of trace essential and non-essential elements such as arsenic and mercury; trace
element deficiencies; exposure to natural dusts and to radioactivity; naturally occurring organic compounds
in drinking water; volcanic emissions, etc. The text also deals with the many health benefits of geologic
materials and processes.

This wide-ranging volume covers issues in medical geology all over the world with each author covering
their respective region. It provides examples from different continents as well as a state-of-the-art review of
the latest developments in the discipline. The authors are all recognized geoscientific and medical experts
working in the field. The book is written for a wide variety of specialists from geologists, geochemists,
pathologists and medical doctors to veterinarians and biologists.
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From reader reviews:

Geraldine Matson:

As people who live in the modest era should be update about what going on or info even knowledge to make
these individuals keep up with the era which is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to you actually is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Medical Geology: A
Regional Synthesis (International Year of Planet Earth) is our recommendation to make you keep up with the
world. Why, because book serves what you want and want in this era.

Jennifer Crowe:

The book untitled Medical Geology: A Regional Synthesis (International Year of Planet Earth) is the book
that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to you.
The language that article author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The
article author was did a lot of analysis when write the book, and so the information that they share for your
requirements is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Medical Geology: A Regional
Synthesis (International Year of Planet Earth) from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Duane Coley:

In this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more valuable
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you are
related is just spending your time not much but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books
in the top record in your reading list will be Medical Geology: A Regional Synthesis (International Year of
Planet Earth). This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in turning out to be
precious person. By looking upward and review this publication you can get many advantages.

Manda Perez:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose
the top book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is identified as of
book Medical Geology: A Regional Synthesis (International Year of Planet Earth). You can add your
knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make you happier to
read. It is most critical that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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