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Ledger of the Open Hand looks at the intimate power of money and emotional debt through the eyes of a
woman trying to grab hold of her own life. Beholden to a shrewd friend and burdened by family obligations
and guilt, Meriel-Claire (MC) finally stumbles into what she’s been missing. She falls in love and finds her
calling as a debt counsellor in the midst of a national financial crisis. But balancing the books for strangers is
easier than reconciling her own complicated relationships. Regrets and deficits accumulate until MC must
decide what she owes to those she loves. With humour and insight, Ledger explores giving, taking, and our
tendency to treat love as a balance sheet.
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From reader reviews:

Hannelore Evans:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take
a stroll, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book called Ledger of the
Open Hand? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time with
the favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have
additional opinion?

Goldie Oleary:

The book with title Ledger of the Open Hand has lot of information that you can study it. You can get a lot
of help after read this book. This book exist new information the information that exist in this e-book
represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the
world. That book will bring you with new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book on your
own smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Arthur McLaurin:

On this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more treasured
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you need
to do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. On the list of
books in the top collection in your reading list is usually Ledger of the Open Hand. This book which is
qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking upward and
review this guide you can get many advantages.

Harold Karr:

You can get this Ledger of the Open Hand by browse the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it
could possibly to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are
various. Not only by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era
such as now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose
your current ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange you to
ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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