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What makes vultures unique?  What two weird defense tricks do turkey vultures use to freak out their
predators? A turkey vulture sounds like ... an industrial vacuum.
  
Readers of the book Survival Secrets of Turkey Vultures will explore these and other adaptations as they join
mother turkey vulture on a hunt to feed her chicks.  The turkey vulture lacks swift aerial moves, talons that
stab, jaws that crush. It can't even defend itself against attackers, kill its prey, or hunt without thermals. Yet
there are many things this vulture can do.

To engage readers, author Debra Toor has combined storytelling techniques with scientific facts and
captivating photographs.  Backmatter includes fun activities to reinforce scientific concepts. A free Teacher's
Guide (Common Core State Standards and Next Generation Science Standards aligned) is also available.

Why should kids learn about vultures?  As future decision makers, kids need to learn about vultures? ?and
their vital ecosystem services.  The recent Asian vulture crisis (which saw 3 species of Gyps vultures
collapse by nearly 96% over a 10 year period during the late 1990s) has presented scientific evidence that
vultures provide the essential ecosystem services of purifying ecosystems and preventing the spread of
diseases. (Statistic source from the 2015 Scientific Study:  Another Continental Vulture Crisis: Africa's
Vultures Collapsing toward Extinction. Conservation Letters.)  
Suggested age range for readers: 9-11.
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From reader reviews:

Gwen Dawes:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to know everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that
guide has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they take because their hobby is usually reading a book. What about the person who don't
like looking at a book? Sometime, individual feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or
perhaps exercise. Well, probably you should have this Survival Secrets of Turkey Vultures.

John Pasko:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information today can get by anyone in everywhere. The
information can be a expertise or any news even a concern. What people must be consider while those
information which is from the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking seriously which one is
acceptable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource then you
obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen inside you if you take Survival Secrets of Turkey Vultures as the daily resource information.

Edwina Hinkle:

The publication with title Survival Secrets of Turkey Vultures includes a lot of information that you can
discover it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This kind of book exist new information the
information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to
yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you within new era of the
globalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

John Bergeron:

You will get this Survival Secrets of Turkey Vultures by go to the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or
reviewing it could possibly to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this
guide are various. Not only by written or printed but can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the
modern era such as now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right
now, choose your own ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange
yourself to make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.
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