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Though not incorporated as a city until 1857, Hamilton can trace its roots back to the founding of Fort
Hamilton by Gen. Arthur St. Clair in 1791.Throughout its history, Hamilton has been “The Greatest Little
City of its Kind in the World,” “The Postmark of Distinctive Trademarks,” and “Known in the World’s
Markets.” In the time between the close of the Civil War and the beginning of World War II, the city thrived.
Led by steadfast pioneers and industrious immigrants, Hamilton developed into a community where anything
seemed possible along the banks of the Great Miami River. The images herein detail Hamilton from 1900 to
the 1950s. From a bustling county seat and the hub of Midwestern industry to leisurely endeavors, from
distinctive neighborhoods to the people who lived in them, and from local education to individual worship,
the life of the city is captured by over 200 postcards of the day, most from the author’s private collection.
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From reader reviews:

Timothy Rowe:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book Hamilton (Postcard History). You can choose the best book
if you appreciate reading a book. Given that we know about how is important a new book Hamilton
(Postcard History). You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by the book.
Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can recognize everything! From your country until finally
foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you are able to
know that. In this era, you can open a book or searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can use
it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's learn.

Noel Stevens:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they are still students or this for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
several personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't want do
that. You must know how great along with important the book Hamilton (Postcard History). All type of book
is it possible to see on many options. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Carmel Smith:

The reserve with title Hamilton (Postcard History) posesses a lot of information that you can understand it.
You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This particular book exist new expertise the information that
exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to find out
how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you in new era of the glowbal growth. You
can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Laurel Ramer:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or
just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Hamilton (Postcard History) can be the
reply, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your spare time by
reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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