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On the surface, the poem describes Dante’s travels through Hell, Purgatory, and Heaven; but at a deeper
level, it represents, allegorically, the soul’s journey towards God. At this deeper level, Dante draws on
medieval Christian theology and philosophy, especially Thomistic philosophy and the Summa Theologica of
Thomas Aquinas. Consequently, the Divine Comedy has been called “the Summa in verse”.
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From reader reviews:

Sonya Ewing:

This book untitled Divine Comedy to be one of several books which best seller in this year, here is because
when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this book in the book store
or you can order it by using online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to
read this book, since you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for your
requirements to past this guide from your list.

Robert Lewis:

Divine Comedy can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight
away because this publication has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to
place every word into delight arrangement in writing Divine Comedy yet doesn't forget the main position,
giving the reader the hottest and based confirm resource details that maybe you can be one of it. This great
information can drawn you into completely new stage of crucial contemplating.

Malcolm Moser:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind ability or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared to can satisfy
your small amount of time to read it because this all time you only find guide that need more time to be
examine. Divine Comedy can be your answer since it can be read by an individual who have those short
spare time problems.

David Murray:

The book untitled Divine Comedy contain a lot of information on it. The writer explains the woman idea
with easy way. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not really worry, you can
easy to read the idea. The book was written by famous author. The author gives you in the new age of
literary works. You can easily read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or program, so you
can read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can wide open their
official web-site and order it. Have a nice examine.
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