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Jane Austen's final novel is her most mature and wickedly satirical. It follows the story of Anne Elliott, who
as a teenager, was engaged to a seemingly ideal man, Frederick Wentworth. But after being persuaded by her
friend Lady Russell that he is too poor to be a suitable match, Anne ends their engagement. When they are
reacquainted eight years later, their circumstances are transformed: Frederick is returning triumphantly from
the Napoleonic War, while Anne's fortunes are floundering. Will their past regrets prevent them from finding
future happiness?

Gorgeously illustrated by Hugh Thomson, this Macmillan Collector's Library edition of Persuasion also
includes an afterword by author and critic Henry Hitchings.

Designed to appeal to the booklover, the Macmillan Collector's Library is a series of beautiful gift editions of
much loved classic titles. Macmillan Collector's Library are books to love and treasure.
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From reader reviews:

Forest Nelson:

Do you one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
this particular aren't like that. This Persuasion (Macmillan Collector's Library Book 19) book is readable
simply by you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable
studying experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer
regarding Persuasion (Macmillan Collector's Library Book 19) content conveys the idea easily to understand
by lots of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the information but it just different such as it.
So , do you nonetheless thinking Persuasion (Macmillan Collector's Library Book 19) is not loveable to be
your top record reading book?

Rose Slagle:

The knowledge that you get from Persuasion (Macmillan Collector's Library Book 19) is the more deep you
rooting the information that hide within the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It doesn't
mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Persuasion (Macmillan Collector's Library Book 19) giving
you buzz feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in certain way that can be understood by means
of anyone who read this because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. That book also makes your
vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We recommend you for having this kind of Persuasion (Macmillan Collector's Library
Book 19) instantly.

James McDonald:

The actual book Persuasion (Macmillan Collector's Library Book 19) has a lot info on it. So when you check
out this book you can get a lot of help. The book was written by the very famous author. The author makes
some research previous to write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can find the point easily
after looking over this book.

Jared Carter:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with friends is thing that usually
you will have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really opposite from
that. One particular activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Persuasion (Macmillan
Collector's Library Book 19), you are able to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still desire to miss
it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its
known as reading friends.
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