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  With a focus on training, "Six Sigma: Concepts, Tools and Techniques" captures the fundamentals of Six
Sigma methodology and shows how to use its tools and techniques to improve customer satisfaction and
business performance. Offering a practitioner's point of view, this book covers key topics such as leadership
and strategic planning; creating a customer focus; quality function deployment; teams and teamwork;
DMAIC problem-solving; measures and metrics; project management; statistical methods; control charts;
design of experiments; reliability; failure modes and effects analysis; and lean manufacturing. Realistic
industry examples support each topic and thoughtful take away tips make it an excellent industry reference.  
Focuses on key topics such as: *Leadership and Strategic Planning *Creating a Customer Focus, *Quality
Function Deployment *Teams and Teamwork *DMAIC Problem-Solving *Measures and Metrics *Project
Management *Statistical Methods *Control Charts *Design of Experiments *Reliability *Failure Modes and
Effects Analysis *Lean Manufacturing.  An excellent resource for anyone who is in business working with
Six Sigma.
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From reader reviews:

Sharon Garcia:

Now a day those who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each info they get. How a lot more to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a book can
help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Six Sigma: Basic Tools and Techniques
(NetEffect) book because this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this
book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Sandra Lowe:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them loved ones or their
friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or perhaps
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different
you can read a new book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day
every day to reading a e-book. The book Six Sigma: Basic Tools and Techniques (NetEffect) it is very good
to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book.
In case you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore simply to
read this book from your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book provides high quality.

Clifford White:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information better
to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You
can observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended to your account is Six Sigma: Basic Tools and Techniques (NetEffect) this guide consist a lot
of the information in the condition of this world now. This particular book was represented just how can the
world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. The actual
writer made some research when he makes this book. Here is why this book suitable all of you.

Betty Patton:

With this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you need
to do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to possess a look at some books. Among the
books in the top record in your reading list is usually Six Sigma: Basic Tools and Techniques (NetEffect).
This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning into precious person. By
looking upward and review this book you can get many advantages.
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