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Dear Reader,

I married the wrong man.

I had every intention of doing the thing right. Of saying my vows and walking out on the arm of Bertie
Milburn. Nice, safe, easygoing Bertie. And that is precisely what I thought I had done.

But as it turned out, I'd been tricked! Tricked into marrying Bertie's twin brother Harry, the Earl of
Cambourne and (as my mother would insist on reminding me at every opportunity) future Duke of Winfell!
And the shocking way in which I found out -- on my wedding night, no less...well, it doesn't bear repeating
here!

And the truth is that Harry, who is my husband, but should not be, makes my hands shake and my heart
pound in a way that Bertie never has and never will. Vexing, dangerously charming Harry, who won't tell me
why he had to marry me, why he insists on masquerading about town as his brother, or most bothersome
still, why he won't stop that annoying (and rather excitingly successful) habit of trying to seduce me!

What is a young lady to do?

Gwen
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From reader reviews:

Virginia McNally:

Throughout other case, little people like to read book The Accidental Duchess. You can choose the best book
if you love reading a book. So long as we know about how is important any book The Accidental Duchess.
You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, since
from book you can learn everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will end up known. About
simple factor until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, you can open a book or searching by
internet unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's learn.

William Carroll:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information presently can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider while those information which is from the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you obtain
the unstable resource then you have it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All
of those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take The Accidental Duchess as your daily
resource information.

Willie Collins:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get great
deal of stress from both everyday life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will
say absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of
activity are there when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer may unlimited right.
Then do you ever try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time,
typically the book you have read is definitely The Accidental Duchess.

Arthur Mead:

The Accidental Duchess can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that
straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to put
every word into pleasure arrangement in writing The Accidental Duchess however doesn't forget the main
place, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be among it.
This great information can certainly drawn you into completely new stage of crucial considering.
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