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This lively and informative new title was originally inspired by the author's Italian mother and her struggles
with the vagaries of the English language. Over the years the author has tried to correct her attempts and
explain why the word she has chosen is incorrect, only to be baffled herself by the lack of logic within those
explanations. English is full of contradictions and peculiarities (not counting such dull grammatical
inconsistencies as 'i before e except after c', which are really no fun at all) and hoodwinks us into believing
one thing while meaning something quite different. In English, all is not what it seems and with this book the
author has brought these illogical oddities to the fore. Questions of spelling, pronunciation or the blatantly
nonsensical are illustrated through clever visual representations that are created entirely through artfully
manipulated typography. heteronyms and introduces the 'antigram' (demonstrating how the swift shuffle of
certain letters can create words that entirely contradict the first: honestly becomes on the sly, earliest
becomes rise late and, fabulously, Elvis = lives!). Monachino goes on to demand an explanation from all
those tricky little words that are spelt the same and pronounced the same, but yet have utterly different
meanings, while highlighting a few of life's petty pleonasms and showing off some quite excellent
tautologies. A gaggle of one-word oxymorons shines the spotlight on words that harbour contradictory words
within them and the final section provides a note on inadvisable hyphenation, which is a useful disco-very,
but perhaps not the best place to beg-in. Because of the linguistic nature of this title there will be a American
English edition.
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From reader reviews:

Charlotte Maas:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try and and must have the free time or they will get lot of
stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely without a
doubt. People is human not only a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you possess when the
spare time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you ever try this
one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you have
read will be Words Fail Me.

Tony Caldwell:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book particularly book
entitled Words Fail Me your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each and every
aspect that maybe not known for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a
guide then become one type conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get previous to. The Words
Fail Me giving you an additional experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful
info for your better life in this particular era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern this is your
body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a. Do you want to try
this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Juan Carrillo:

This Words Fail Me is completely new way for you who has curiosity to look for some information as it
relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still
having bit of digest in reading this Words Fail Me can be the light food to suit your needs because the
information inside that book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books build itself in the form and that
is reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in publication form
make them feel drowsy even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a guide
especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss the idea! Just
read this e-book sort for your better life in addition to knowledge.

Earl Parker:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a guide. They are directly felt that when they get a
half regions of the book. You can choose typically the book Words Fail Me to make your reading is
interesting. Your own personal skill of reading skill is developing when you including reading. Try to choose
straightforward book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the opinion about book and looking at
especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to wide open a book and go through it. Beside that the
publication Words Fail Me can to be a newly purchased friend when you're really feel alone and confuse in
what must you're doing of that time.
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