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Core Awareness, Revised Edition: Enhancing Yoga, Pilates, Exercise, and Dance offers a guide to Core
Awareness, a body-oriented approach that explores the practice of bringing focus and attention to inner
sensation as the means of cultivating an innate capacity for expressive movement. Developed by somatic
educator and author Liz Koch, the book's Core Awareness movements, stretches, and mindfulness
explorations are designed to enhance sensory development and shift readers from the standard paradigm of
the body as an "isolated object" to a holistic paradigm of the human being as part of a living process of
dynamic expression. This shift in perspective offers practitioners and teachers of movement, yoga, pilates,
bodywork, exercise, and dance an empowering model for self-healing and the key to increasing strength,
gaining flexibility, preventing injury, and improving resiliency.

Describing the practice of moving from one's core, Koch highlights the importance of engaging the psoas
muscle—located on either side of the spine—to integrate the body, mind, emotion, and spirit. Koch also
discusses the pelvis as the foundation of our physical core and the vital connection with our bones to gain a
sense of support, nourishment, joint integrity, skeletal balance, and healthy muscle tone. Rewritten with
updated information, this revised edition includes 247 new photos and 25 new Core Awareness
explorations—with 64 in total. A suggested reading list at the end of the book provides resources for
continuing the development of the ideas presented within the book.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Gary Rose:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As you may
know that book is very important for us. The book Core Awareness, Revised Edition: Enhancing Yoga,
Pilates, Exercise, and Dance was making you to know about other information and of course you can take
more information. It is very advantages for you. The guide Core Awareness, Revised Edition: Enhancing
Yoga, Pilates, Exercise, and Dance is not only giving you a lot more new information but also for being your
friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your e-book. Try to make
relationship together with the book Core Awareness, Revised Edition: Enhancing Yoga, Pilates, Exercise,
and Dance. You never truly feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Susan Tokarz:

Here thing why that Core Awareness, Revised Edition: Enhancing Yoga, Pilates, Exercise, and Dance are
different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all examining a book is good but it depends in the content from
it which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Core Awareness, Revised Edition: Enhancing Yoga,
Pilates, Exercise, and Dance giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any guide out
there but there is no publication that similar with Core Awareness, Revised Edition: Enhancing Yoga,
Pilates, Exercise, and Dance. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your personal eyes about
the thing that will happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you. You can bring
everywhere like in park, café, or even in your technique home by train. If you are having difficulties in
bringing the printed book maybe the form of Core Awareness, Revised Edition: Enhancing Yoga, Pilates,
Exercise, and Dance in e-book can be your alternative.

Virginia Cherry:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a guide you will get new information simply because book is one of many ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you more imaginative. When you
studying a book especially fiction book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the people do it
anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to some others. When you read this Core Awareness,
Revised Edition: Enhancing Yoga, Pilates, Exercise, and Dance, you could tells your family, friends as well
as soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a book.

Clarine Davidson:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update of news. Within
this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social



such as newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to
find the Core Awareness, Revised Edition: Enhancing Yoga, Pilates, Exercise, and Dance when you needed
it?
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