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The spiritual teachings of Israel’s biblical prophetesses from a kabbalistic perspective

• Explores the lives and symbolic significance of seven female prophets: Sarah, Miriam, Devorah, Chanah,
Avigail, Chuldah, and Esther

• Uses the gematria of Jewish metaphysics to demonstrate that prophecy is a mystical initiatory path by
which Divine Will is made known, not only a tool for telling the future

• Presents practical applications of kabbalistic teachings for spiritual development

The seven prophetesses of Israel--Sarah, Miriam, Devorah, Chanah, Avigail, Chuldah, and Esther--lived
between 1800 and 350 BCE. Their combined lives reflect a kabbalistic path of spiritual evolution that is as
pertinent to our lives today as it was for the biblical communities in which they lived.

From her studies of the Torah and classical gematria, Zohara Hieronimus shows that each prophetess is
linked to a Sefirah on the kabbalistic Tree of Life: from creation (Sarah) through learning correct moral
action (Devorah) to the promise of redemption and ultimately resurrection (Esther). Using the stories of their
lives and teachings, Hieronimus reveals the relationship of each prophetess to the seven days of the week, the
seven sacred species of Israel, the human body, and Jewish holidays and rituals.

This book presents the kabbalistic teachings of these holy women and what they reveal about the initiatory
path of individual development and redemption. The seven prophetesses show that every person has a part to
play in the repair of the world, and Hieronimus gives a practical set of maps and spiritual guidelines for that
journey.
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From reader reviews:

Joanne Hall:

Now a day people who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each info they get. How individuals to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Studying a book
can help people out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Kabbalistic Teachings of the Female
Prophets: The Seven Holy Women of Ancient Israel book since this book offers you rich info and
knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already
know.

David Henry:

This Kabbalistic Teachings of the Female Prophets: The Seven Holy Women of Ancient Israel is brand-new
way for you who has fascination to look for some information because it relief your hunger associated with.
Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having tiny amount of digest
in reading this Kabbalistic Teachings of the Female Prophets: The Seven Holy Women of Ancient Israel can
be the light food in your case because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get through anyone.
These books produce itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book contact
form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel tired even dizzy this guide is the answer. So you
cannot find any in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here
for anyone. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book style for your better life and knowledge.

James Anderson:

In this particular era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more important
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you are
related is just spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of the
books in the top collection in your reading list will be Kabbalistic Teachings of the Female Prophets: The
Seven Holy Women of Ancient Israel. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you
closer in getting precious person. By looking right up and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Thomas Gonzalez:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book but in addition novel and Kabbalistic Teachings of the Female
Prophets: The Seven Holy Women of Ancient Israel as well as others sources were given knowledge for you.
After you know how the good a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science e-book was created for
teacher or maybe students especially. Those publications are helping them to put their knowledge. In some
other case, beside science guide, any other book likes Kabbalistic Teachings of the Female Prophets: The



Seven Holy Women of Ancient Israel to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like
this.
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