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With the advent of Flash Communication Server MX (FCS), Macromedia believes that it's on the edge of a
breakthrough in how people think about the Internet. FCS has been designed to provide web developers with
the means to add polished interactive audio and video features to their sites, the sort of features that users
have come to expect.Naturally, the process of efficiently integrating rich media into applications, web sites,
and web content is a complex one, to say the least. That's where Programming Flash Communication Server
factors in. As the foremost reference on FCS, it helps readers understand how FCS can facilitate:

Video on demand●

Live webcasts●

Video chat and messaging●

Shared desktop conferences●

Live auctions●

Interactive whiteboard presentations●

Workflow collaboration●

Multi-user games●

Programming Flash Communication Server not only explains how to use the pre-built FCS components to
construct a simple application, it also explains the architecture so that developers can program custom
components to make even more advanced applications. In addition, the book explains how to truly optimize
performance, and talks about considerations for networked applications as well as the media issues
pertaining to FCS.Programming Flash Communication Server gives developers a sorely needed leg up on
this potentially intimidating technology. It lets users develop cool web applications ranging from direct
dating experiences with real-time video, to pre-recorded corporate presentations, to news services with video
and audio, and much more.At last, the ability to build web sites with rich interactive features--minus the
complex downloads and installation hassles--is a reality. And now, with Programming Flash
Communication Server from O'Reilly by your side, you can do more quickly and easily than you ever
dreamed possible.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Nelson:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive at this point, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
Yes, by reading a book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand than other is high. To
suit your needs who want to start reading a book, we give you that Programming Flash Communication
Server book as beginner and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Stewart Moore:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading
practice give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge your information inside
the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
reserve you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want experience
happy read one with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Often the Programming Flash
Communication Server is kind of reserve which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Mary Fix:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot
of information that will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with their
story or maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the textbooks. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve
their skill in writing, they also doing some research before they write to the book. One of them is this
Programming Flash Communication Server.

Harold Thompson:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book specifically book entitled
Programming Flash Communication Server your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in every aspect that maybe not known for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging each
word written in a reserve then become one type conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get just
before. The Programming Flash Communication Server giving you one more experience more than blown
away your head but also giving you useful data for your better life in this era. So now let us teach you the
relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished looking
at it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?
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