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Cholera was the classic epidemic disease of the nineteenth century, as the plague had been for the fourteenth.
Its defeat was a reflection not only of progress in medical knowledge but of enduring changes in American
social thought. Rosenberg has focused his study on New York City, the most highly developed center of this
new society. Carefully documented, full of descriptive detail, yet written with an urgent sense of the drama
of the epidemic years, this narrative is as absorbing for general audiences as it is for the medical historian. In
a new Afterword, Rosenberg discusses changes in historical method and concerns since the original
publication of The Cholera Years.

"A major work of interpretation of medical and social thought . . . this volume is also to be commended for
its skillful, absorbing presentation of the background and the effects of this dread disease."—I.B. Cohen,
New York Times

"The Cholera Years is a masterful analysis of the moral and social interest attached to epidemic disease,
providing generally applicable insights into how the connections between social change, changes in
knowledge and changes in technical practice may be conceived."—Steven Shapin, Times Literary
Supplement

"In a way that is all too rarely done, Rosenberg has skillfully interwoven medical, social, and intellectual
history to show how medicine and society interacted and changed during the 19th century. The history of
medicine here takes its rightful place in the tapestry of human history."—John B. Blake, Science
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From reader reviews:

Evelyn Spencer:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that reserve
has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. These are reading whatever
they get because their hobby is actually reading a book. Think about the person who don't like looking at a
book? Sometime, particular person feel need book once they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise.
Well, probably you should have this The Cholera Years: The United States in 1832, 1849, and 1866.

Kenneth Salinas:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys
this aren't like that. This The Cholera Years: The United States in 1832, 1849, and 1866 book is readable by
you who hate the straight word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable looking at
experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer
associated with The Cholera Years: The United States in 1832, 1849, and 1866 content conveys objective
easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it
just different by means of it. So , do you nonetheless thinking The Cholera Years: The United States in 1832,
1849, and 1866 is not loveable to be your top record reading book?

Billy Taylor:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this The Cholera Years: The United States in
1832, 1849, and 1866 e-book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that
may be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas
and producing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still skepticism The Cholera Years: The
United States in 1832, 1849, and 1866 as good book but not only by the cover but also with the content. This
is one publication that can break don't evaluate book by its protect, so do you still needing a different sixth
sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already said so why you have to
listening to yet another sixth sense.

Josephine Draughn:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Cholera Years: The United
States in 1832, 1849, and 1866 can be the respond to, oh how comes? A book you know. You are
consequently out of date, spending your time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So
what these publications have than the others?
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