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What do you send your alien pen pal Clunk to make it clear you do not want an alien pen pal? You send him
your big sister. That'll teach Clunk to have a pen pal from Earth-or so our intrepid narrator thinks. But then
Clunk sends him a Zoid, an exasperating Zoid that follows him everywhere. After swapping dirty socks,
three Forps, some old lasagna, a weird glob, and a string of Christmas lights, our hero seems to be having . . .
could it be . . . fun? But then: Clunk stops sending stuff. Oh no! Earth to Clunk . . . ? Is he too busy being
bossed around by our hero's big sister? Will her ever send another package again? Maybe-or maybe not.
More hilarious surprises await!

Deadpan comedy, vibrant artwork (a bit Calvin & Hobbes, a bit Eloise), a warm friendship theme, and an
extraordinary surprise ending will have kids laughing all the way back to the first page of this sweet-in-spite-
of-itself story.
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From reader reviews:

Armando Ceballos:

The book Earth to Clunk make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable
more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem with the
subject. If you can make looking at a book Earth to Clunk for being your habit, you can get a lot more
advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You are able to
know everything if you like wide open and read a publication Earth to Clunk. Kinds of book are a lot of. It
means that, science publication or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Courtney O\'Donnell:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a book you will get new information simply because book is one of a number of
ways to share the information or even their idea. Second, reading through a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring one to
imagine the story how the figures do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to some others.
When you read this Earth to Clunk, you may tells your family, friends and soon about yours publication.
Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a publication.

Alan Durham:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you learn a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and also
soon. The Earth to Clunk provide you with new experience in looking at a book.

Aaron Thomsen:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more special than other. Do
you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you have to do is just
spending your time not much but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books in the top
checklist in your reading list is definitely Earth to Clunk. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can
get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking way up and review this e-book you can get many
advantages.
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